
Employers Supporting 
RFSQ Volunteers



About the Rural Fire 
Service Queensland 
(RFSQ)
Rural Fire Service Queensland form a 
part of the Queensland Fire 
Department (QFD).

Rural Fire Service Queensland 
(RFSQ) is made up of over 27,000 
volunteers, who form more than 1,400 
Rural Fire Brigades (RFBs).

Brigades around the state provide 
essential services to the people of their 
community and deliver fire and incident 
response coverage to 93% of the 
state.



• Fighting Fires

• Fire Risk Mitigation Activities

• Community Education – 
Preparedness Activities

• Permits to Light Fire

• Initial and on-going Training

• Deployments – National and 
International (can be requested)

• Community – Severe Event 
Response and Recovery Assistance

RFSQ – Responsibilities – Volunteer Involvement



RFSQ Volunteers and 
their Employers

Volunteers provide fire and emergency 
preparation and response across all 
areas of the State, and without their 
highly skilled contribution the 
prevention, preparedness, response 
and recovery of Queensland would be 
severely compromised.

Without the on-going support of 
employers to grant leave of absence 
and release our volunteers from their 
regular work duties, most communities 
would face greatly increased risks and 
heightened out-come consequences.



• Volunteers should discuss release 
from work provisions with their 
employer

• Arrangements may be informal 
(verbal) or formal (written)

• Determine what type of leave is to be 
used – e.g. Annual, Accrued, Special, 
Community Service, Without Pay

• The decision of leave release is at the 
employer's discretion

Employee Leave



https://www.fairwork.gov.au/sites
/default/files/migration/723/Com
munity-service-leave.pdf

National Employment 
Standards – Community 
Service Leave Fact Sheet

https://www.fairwork.gov.au/sites/default/files/migration/723/Community-service-leave.pdf
https://www.fairwork.gov.au/sites/default/files/migration/723/Community-service-leave.pdf
https://www.fairwork.gov.au/sites/default/files/migration/723/Community-service-leave.pdf


Benefits

RFSQ volunteers make valuable 
employees and are equipped with a 
broad range of capabilities that are 
useful in the workplace.  

• working well in teams and following 
directions

• communicating effectively

• thinking on their feet

• taking responsibility

• using personal initiative

• remaining calm in a crisis



Employer Incentives

Employers make a significant 
contribution to the community when 
releasing staff to respond to 
emergencies.

The Queensland Government 
recognises this through payroll tax 
exemptions for the hours staff spend 
away from work to assist in emergency 
operations.

For more information on payroll tax 
exemptions call the Queensland 
Revenue Office on 1300 300 734 
during office hours or visit their website.

https://qro.qld.gov.au/payroll-tax/exemptions/wages/


Visit:

https://www.fire.qld.gov.au/about-
us/frontline-services/rural-fire-
service-queensland

Want to know more ?

https://www.fire.qld.gov.au/about-us/frontline-services/rural-fire-service-queensland
https://www.fire.qld.gov.au/about-us/frontline-services/rural-fire-service-queensland
https://www.fire.qld.gov.au/about-us/frontline-services/rural-fire-service-queensland


THANK YOU !


	Slide 1
	Slide 2: About the Rural Fire Service Queensland (RFSQ)
	Slide 3: RFSQ – Responsibilities – Volunteer Involvement
	Slide 4: RFSQ Volunteers and their Employers
	Slide 5: Employee Leave
	Slide 6: National Employment Standards – Community Service Leave Fact Sheet
	Slide 7: Benefits
	Slide 8: Employer Incentives
	Slide 9: Want to know more ?
	Slide 10

